
Ref. No: AISCD/APDBC/Australia/2024      Date: 18-04-2024 
 

MEMORANDUM – 1 
 
 Sub: - DIBF Asia Pacific Basketball Championships, Melbourne, Australia on September 22  

to 29, 2024 – National Selection Trial – Announcement – Regarding 
 
It is a pleasure to inform you all that as per the communication dated 04-04-2024 from the ICSD 
Associate Member – Deaf International Basketball Federation, the 2024 Asia Pacific Deaf Basketball 
Championships is scheduled to be held at Melbourne, Australia on September 22 to 29, 2024.   
 
It may be noted that the details for this Championship have not been included in our ACTC Proposal 
Templates 2024-2025 due to the late receipt of the information from DIBF.  After a long discussion 
with Mr. Balamurugan PG, AISCD Basketball Technical Director, it is decided that the Indian Team 
will have to bear their own expenses for the National Coaching Camp and Participation to the DIBF 
Asia Pacific Deaf Basketball Championships, Melbourne, Australia.  The TNSCD has their willingness 
to host the One-Day National Basketball Selection Trial.  
 
The One-Day National Selection Trial is fixed to be held at the Outdoor Basketball Court, Jawaharlal 
Nehru Indoor Stadium, Periyamet, Chennai, Tamil Nadu on Monday 29th of April, 2024 from 08:00AM 
till the end.   
 
The names of players, who have taken part and have selected on the basis of their performance in the 
25th National Deaf Senior Sports Championship, Indore, Madhya Pradesh in February 2023, are given 
below: 
 

SL.NO NAME DOB STATE 

1 R. SRI VENKATESH 02.06.1982 TAMILNADU 

2 V.KRISHNAN 15.18.1983 TAMILNADU 

3 R.VISHNU RAM 20.07.1999 TAMILNADU 

4 P. DEVA 31.08.1993 TAMILNADU 

5 KUMARAVEL 20.10.1985 TAMILNADU 

6 M.NAVIN KUMAR 03.12.1999 TAMILNADU 

7 A. SAMUVEL 17.07.1996 TAMILNADU 

8 MITHUN BALAN 02.05.1998 TAMILNADU 

9 P. G. BALAMURUGAN 06.04.1979 TAMILNADU 

10 VINODH KUMAR V 30.11.1981 BENGALRU  

11 AVINASH S  30.03.1990 BENGALRU  

12 RAGHAVENDRA K GANI 01.01.1985 BENGALRU  

13 SHUBAM SINGH  02.08.1997 BENGALRU  

14 ROHINTH .M 18-Aug-95 PONDICHERRY 

15 YESU KUMAR 30-Nov-97 ANDHRA PRADESH 

16 SANDREASH .S 11-Nov-05 PONDICHERRY 



17 VISHNU KUMAR .G 24-Dec-04 PONDICHERRY 

18 MANOJ TARAI 10.09.1997 ORISSA 

19 AJAY YADAV 20-09-2005 MADHYA PRADESH 

20 AMIT BARDIYA 08-03-1994 MADHYA PRADESH 

 
This is an Open National Selection Trial and only 20 (sixteen only) players mentioned above are invited 
to take part in the trial.  No sort of any allowance like Travel Expenses, Food & Accommodation, etc 
will be paid during the Trial.  The Entry Fee of Rs. 3,000.00 (Rupees three thousand only) per athlete 
/ player shall be paid to AISCD through Affiliated State Units under their jurisdiction before 25-04-2024 
and respective state units are responsible for their participation.   
 
Strictly no parents or personal coach will be allowed inside the Campus during the Selection Trial, 
failing which strict disciplinary action is liable to be taken against the concerned player like temporary 
/ permanent ban.  
 
All the Affiliated State Units are requested to ensure that athletes listed in this memorandum hold at 
least six-month Valid Passport along with 6 numbers of PP Size Colour Photograph (Latest 80% Face 
with White Background) to contact Ms. Balamurugan PG, AISCD Technical Director – Basketball by 
e-mail ID: pgbalamurugan@gmail.com or by Mobile No: +91 98655 11489 directly.  Note that those 
who has not hold his valid passport shall not be allowed to enter in the Trial. 
 
Late Entry Form & Fee will not be accepted.  
 
Looking forward to the pleasure of receiving your kind co-operation in the matter and thanking you. 
 
For & On behalf of ALL INDIA SPORTS COUNCIL OF THE DEAF, 
 
 
G. Suresh Kumar 
Hony. General Secretary 
 
To 

1. All AISCD Affiliated State Units 

2. All AISCD OBs and EBMs  

3. All AISCD TDs 

 


